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Physical Examination Waiver (CIF Bylaw 503.G.): 

In order to address the impact that the COVID-19 virus and school closures have had on students, and in 
recognition that families may experience delays in obtaining appointments for their student for a 
Preparticipation Physical Examination, governing boards of school districts and private schools may elect 
to provide a one-time, temporary waiver of Bylaw 503.G. that must be signed by the student athlete’s 
parent/legal guardian and submitted to the high school administration before the student may tryout, 
practice or participate in interscholastic athletic competition. This waiver will allow the student athlete 
to participate in athletics for a maximum of thirty (30) calendar days from their school's first day of 
practice in that sport. This waiver only applies to CIF sanctioned Fall 2020 sports. Further, a waiver may 
only be obtained if the high school has a Preparticipation Physical Examination for the 2019-2020 on file 
for the student athlete or, in the event the high school does not have on file the student's 2019-2020 
Preparticipation Physical Examination, the parent/legal guardian may provide a copy of the student 
athlete's 2019-2020 Preparticipation Physical Examination to the school administration. This waiver also 
applies to incoming 9th graders and transfer students. An incoming 9th grader may request a waiver if 
they are able to provide a copy of a 2019-2020 Preparticipation Physical Examination or Well Child 
Check. An incoming transfer student may request a waiver if they are able to provide a copy of a 2019-
2020 Preparticipation Physical Examination. After termination of the temporary thirty (30) day waiver 
period, the student athlete must submit a current 2020-2021 Preparticipation Physical Examination in 
order to continue participating in interscholastic athletics. 

In order to be granted a temporary waiver of the Pre-Participation Physical Examination (Bylaw 503.G.), 
the parent/legal guardian and student MUST complete, sign and submit to their school administration 
the required 503.G. Waiver and Release of Liability Form. 

In addition to the requirements discussed above, a student athlete requesting a temporary waiver must 
submit to the school administration a student Health Screening Form completed and signed by the 
student's parent/legal guardian prior to participating in tryouts, practice or interscholastic athletic 
competition. 

These documents will be posted on the CIF website in the coming weeks (www.cifstate.org). 

 


